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Seamus Power
Quick Quotes

Q.  Seamus, not the finish you wanted today, but just
thoughts overall on the week at Congaree.

SEAMUS POWER:  It was a fun week.  A little bit of a
frustrating finish there.  Didn't do a whole lot wrong and just
kind of got -- just hit a couple of bad spots.  Overall, a fun
week.  Always nice playing a new golf course, very cool
kind of layout, very enjoyable.  All in all, can't complain.

Q.  Take something out of getting back in the mix. 
Obviously, those three birdies early kind of vaulted
you up the leaderboard.

SEAMUS POWER:  I played really nicely there, and
around the turn I just missed on 10, 11, 12, like rolled along
the edge on all three.  I guess that kind of lost my
momentum.  A bit of a sloppy bogey on 14 and kind of a bit
of a mess on 16, just kind of hit it over the green where it
wasn't quite on the course as well as you want, hit it in a
spot where I really shouldn't have and ended up making a
double.  Good looks on 17 and 18, and they just kind of
missed as well.  It was just one of those frustrating days.

Q.  What do you have coming up?  Anything you're
trying to improve upon?

SEAMUS POWER:  I'm not in the U.S. Open.  I won't be in
Travelers now.  I'm going to probably do a Monday qualifier
for Travelers, look at the Korn Ferry schedule, and
hopefully get a little run going this summer on the PGA
TOUR.
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