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Quick Quotes Afternoon Four-balls

Q.  Try to describe for us what goes through your mind
and your body when you hole such a crucial putt on
the 18th in front of this enormous crowd?

VIKTOR HOVLAND:  It was about time the ball went in.  I
felt like we played some really good golf today, and the
Americans played some great golf as well and they kept
pushing us and yeah, -- to make a putt like that on the last
hole that was huge for the team.

Q.  2 DOWN and five to play; Tyrrell, how dig did you
have to deep against such a formidable pairing?  They
have never been beater in four-ball.

TYRRELL HATTON:  Yeah, it was always going to be a
tough task.  But we both played great today.  And like he
said, it was nice to finally see a putt go in there on the last. 
It was a tough match but we just kept plugging away, gave
ourselves opportunities and yeah, ultimately by the end
we're happy with half a point.

VIKTOR HOVLAND:  I thought one of us needed to make
the putt and to make that one was really cool.  Put a little
bit more pressure on J.T. there.

Q.  Both of you won your matches this morning.  How
much does it mean to still contribute something this
afternoon?

TYRRELL HATTON:  Yeah, the team went out this
afternoon in a good mood.  Although we found ourselves 2
DOWN through, what is it, 13?  We feel like we played
decent and putts weren't really dropping for us.

So yeah, obviously Viktor to hole the putt on the last was
amazing.  I think I almost corkscrewed into the ground
fist-pumping.  Yeah, they might need to prepare that one
before anyone has that putt.
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