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Q.  We're here with Jeeno today.  In the third round,
you went 8-under par, leading up to 4th place.  How
are you feeling right now?

JEENO THITIKUL:  Feeling great.  Like, I've been hitting
good for the past three days.  But couldn't make a putt for
the plus-2 round.  But make more putts today on the third
round, which is the nice.

Q.  Some players are just going to succeed, so some
believing that you'll climb up the leaderboards today.
 So did you share the same belief in the first two
rounds?

JEENO THITIKUL:  I mean, like I said, I've been hitting
pretty good.  I'm not really thinking about the one at all,
because, like, I can't make -- I can't make putt at all.

But I hit it so good.  I mean, when it's -- like when I
finished today, I knew that it, like, came up to the
leaderboard, which is like -- so I really wanted to end the
week as well, be in contention, week in, week out, which
is really good, because it's kind of like my experience, get
into it, those pressure kind of things, you know, the
leaderboard is the one that we're looking forward to climb
up.

Q.  (Foreign language.)

JEENO THITIKUL:  My putting is good today.  It's, like,
windy.  Yeah, I think the greens -- I mean, I think it's kind
of a hilly course on top of the mountain.  I think the speed
and the lies should be really perfect to get into the hole,
which is I really figure it out after my first true round.

I mean, today, I thought just try less to, you know,
making it in.  I just putt to where I wanted to and then just
get the lie, and as much as possible, because, like, I
always kept, you know, like, under-read it.

So, yeah, today was a little windy.  So I think some hole
we get that one edge of it, but some holes we just have
to hit ball longer than the past two days.

Q.  Lastly, I want to hear how are you preparing for

the final round mentally or physically?

JEENO THITIKUL:  You know, I just -- I think focusing is
the most important key for me.  I've been really focusing
on the targets that I want to hit, not really afraid of once
it's going to go left or right.  But I just really want to hit
into my target.

I think the past few days or past few weeks, it's been
really good.  And then if I can keep that in my mind, my
mindset, I think it should be good tomorrow.
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