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Q.  I'm going to start with you, Wes.  It looked like you
were having fun out there, especially I love the way to
the gallery on the make there on the final hole.  That
exemplified the fun you were having today, doesn't it?

WESLEY BRYAN:  We had a great time.  I'll be honest,
there were times when we were absolutely lost physically
on the golf course, but we kept the vibes high.

Yeah, that was to cap off my -- I think my third birdie in a
row on the par-3s.

TREY MULLINAX:  Yes, it was.

WESLEY BRYAN:  And we kept making some Call of Duty
references, specialist bonus engaged on the par-3.  When
the last one dropped, I waved off all the crowd.  Even if
they weren't clapping, most of them were, I just wanted to
give them the courtesy wave.

Q.  I enjoyed it.  It was great to see.  You talk about the
Call of Duty references.  That's part of this event, isn't
it, Trey, the camaraderie you have with a teammate?

TREY MULLINAX:  Yes, absolutely.  Wesley, he played
great.  There was a few times out there today we kind of
didn't know where it was going, but I thought we scrambled
around really well.  We hung in there.  Our attitudes were
good.

He had to kind of give me a little kick in the butt a couple of
times.

WESLEY BRYAN:  After your horrible blunder from 130
yards in the middle of the fairway.  Only bogey blemish on
the card.

TREY MULLINAX:  It wasn't my finest moment.  But then I
made up for it and made the next one.

WESLEY BRYAN:  He did, he jarred the next one.

TREY MULLINAX:  I jarred it from the rough on the other
hole.  Yeah, I thought we did a great job.  We hung in
there.  It was good to get the one on the last, and I was
glad he made that putt because I really didn't want to putt.

Q.  You guys sound like the grill room on league night
complaining about each other.

WESLEY BRYAN:  Trey's one of my good buds.  That's
how I kind of gauge my good buds.  If I'm able to -- if I'm
too nice to you, you should probably be a little bit worried. 
It means I don't like you too much.
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